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An indigenous poet of the Nuosu (Yi) people of mountainous southwestern China, Jidi Majia is well known
and celebrated among the Chinese. But his lyrical and worldly work, though widely published and honored,
has not found its voice in English translation in the West. The poems in Rhapsody in Black, presented in
Chinese and deftly translated by the gifted and respected Denis Mair, at long last introduce the English-
speaking world to this remarkable Chinese writer.

The poetry of Jidi Majia is deeply grounded in the myths and oral traditions of the Nuosu minority. It evokes
times past but also speaks with eloquence of our global moment. Replete with cultural textures and local
idiom, the poems provide an exquisite opening into the Nuosu world. In their ethnic richness, they also
resonate with the voices of the indigenous and the dispossessed, from Native American and South American
Indian poets to the African American and aboriginal Australian writers preserving and reshaping cultural
identity.

Jidi Majia’s voice sounds the depths of natural, cultural, and spiritual reality. In his poem “Voice of the
Bimo,” the power of a Nuosu ritualist’s expression is reflected in his own:

            In tones both human and divine, it utters
            A praise song for birth and death
            When it invokes sun, stars, rivers, and ancient heroes
            When it summons deities and surreal powers
            Departed beings commence their resurrection!

The poems in this volume broaden and deepen our experience of the world—Jidi Majia’s and our own.
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From reader reviews:

Marjorie Brown:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book
Series) book is readable by means of you who hate those straight word style. You will find the details here
are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that
want to give to you. The writer connected with Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book
Series) content conveys objective easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not
different in the information but it just different in the form of it. So , do you even now thinking Rhapsody in
Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book Series) is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Michael Johnson:

This Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book Series) tend to be reliable for you who
want to be a successful person, why. The explanation of this Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature
Today Book Series) can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just
simple examining food but feed a person with information that probably will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-
book and printed versions. Beside that this Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book
Series) giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical
thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Danny Floyd:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many
ways to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, examining a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring
someone to imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to
other individuals. When you read this Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book Series),
you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the
others, make them reading a reserve.

Elvis Harris:

Beside this Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book Series) in your phone, it could
possibly give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you
are going to got here is fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an outdated people live
in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Rhapsody in Black: Poems (Chinese Literature Today Book



Series) because this book offers to you readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you don't get
what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set
up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item?
Find this book and also read it from now!
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