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Marissa can make any man her sex slave with a single kiss. But sex without love has begun to feel empty,
turning her magical gift into a curse. The only way to get rid of it is with a counter-spell from her family’s
spell book. Unfortunately, a rival witch has stolen it. To get it back, Marissa accepts the witch’s challenge.
She must make a man fall in love with her without using her power.

Justin has always been attracted to Marissa but has kept his distance because he knows she’s trouble. He has
seen her with a different man every night, and when she puts the moves on him, he’s determined not to
become just another conquest.

Marissa must learn what true love really means in order to convince Justin she’s more than a seductress. And
Justin is just the man to teach her.

Reader Advisory: This story has graphic sexual language and scenes—no closed bedroom doors (or other
rooms) here!

A Romantica® paranormal erotic romance from Ellora’s Cave
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From reader reviews:

Gerri Townsend:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time? Yep,
you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time
to take a move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book entitled Cursed
Kiss? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other
opinion?

Roger Patrick:

The book Cursed Kiss gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Cursed Kiss to become your habit, you can get
far more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like wide open and read a publication Cursed Kiss. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this
reserve?

Bessie Hall:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for you is Cursed Kiss this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this
world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles that
writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some analysis when he makes this book. Here
is why this book ideal all of you.

Beth French:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare?
Why so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and Cursed Kiss as well as others sources
were given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel would like to read
more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those guides are
helping them to bring their knowledge. In various other case, beside science guide, any other book likes
Cursed Kiss to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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