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Connected at the chest by a band of flesh, Chang and Eng Bunker toured the United States and the world
from the 1820s to the 1870s, placing themselves and their extraordinary bodies on exhibit as "freaks of
nature" and "Oriental curiosities." More famously known as the Siamese twins, they eventually settled in
rural North Carolina, married two white sisters, became slave owners, and fathered twenty-one children
between them. Though the brothers constantly professed their normality, they occupied a strange space in
nineteenth-century America. They spoke English, attended church, became American citizens, and backed
the Confederacy during the Civil War. Yet in life and death, the brothers were seen by most Americans as
"monstrosities," an affront they were unable to escape.

Joseph Andrew Orser chronicles the twins' history, their sometimes raucous journey through antebellum
America, their domestic lives in North Carolina, and what their fame revealed about the changing racial and
cultural landscape of the United States. More than a biography of the twins, the result is a study of
nineteenth-century American culture and society through the prism of Chang and Eng that reveals how
Americans projected onto the twins their own hopes and fears.
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From reader reviews:

Jose York:

The actual book The Lives of Chang and Eng: Siam's Twins in Nineteenth-Century America will bring that
you the new experience of reading any book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to
find new book to read, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Lives of Chang and Eng: Siam's
Twins in Nineteenth-Century America is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book
from the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Alfred Zoeller:

The book The Lives of Chang and Eng: Siam's Twins in Nineteenth-Century America has a lot of
information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled
by the very famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write this book. That book very easy to read
you can obtain the point easily after perusing this book.

Yolanda Ocasio:

You can spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This The Lives of Chang and Eng: Siam's Twins
in Nineteenth-Century America is simple to create you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as
well as soon. If you did not possess much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-
book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Tyler Cote:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or even
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's internal or real
their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't see colorful pictures
on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know that on this
age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this The Lives of Chang and Eng: Siam's Twins in Nineteenth-Century America can make you
sense more interested to read.
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